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BASF has technical expertise in
production, marketing and distribution of
fortified foods (e.g. condiments, flour, milk,
oil, ready-to-use therapeutic food, rice,
sugar).
 
Training and test kits - Technical
application training for production and
analysis of staple foods with
micronutrients. The objective of the
training is to enable small and medium
scale millers to see food fortification
practices first hand and to build their
capacity to fortify staple foods.
 
Multi-stakeholder advocacy - Training on
outreach and partnership expertise in food
fortification.

Areas of technical expertise for potential technical assistance transfer

BASF is a producer of feed additives for
use in compound feed, special feedstuffs
and supplementary feeds.
 
Fat reduction and yield increase in milk - 
BASF's feed additives Lutrell® Pure and
Lutalin® increase milk yield, reduce milk
fat and improve blood glucose levels in
lactating cows.

Agricultural practices and crop
management - BASF provides training on
good agricultural practices, alongside
solutions and recommendations on how to
protect crops for optimum yield and quality.
In addition, BASF support farmers from
seed to successful harvest with innovative
genetics, nutrient management products
and digital services.

 
Aflatoxin mitigation - BASF owns several
technologies along the food value chain,
such as aflatoxin binders for feed and
food.
 
Quality assessment and control devices -
Quality assessment tools (test-kits) and
technical trainings on their use.
 
BASF organises fortification workshops
to build government and private sector
capacity in quality assurance and control. 
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